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Membership Benefits
Network

Community

Learn

Visibility

Grow

VoiceCredibility
Not only are you recognized

as a community builder, 
but potential customers 
are also more likely to 
do business with you.

The chamber provides
excellent opportunities for
individuals to network with

legislators, government
officials, and city
representatives.

Our goal is to foster
growth and prosperity
within the community.
Let's work together to
achieve this and help

each other thrive.

Collaborate with
community groups to
foster togetherness
through events and

activities.

 By participating in
chamber activities, you'll

receive plenty of
exposure that will help
raise your profile in the
community and beyond.

Join forces with like-
minded individuals to build

and reinforce your
business network.  

Remember, we are always
stronger when we work

together.

Our goal is to present
educational topics and

opportunities to benefit
our members.

Huron Chamber & Visitors Bureau
1725 Dakota Ave S - Huron SD

(605) 352-0000
www.huronsd.com

Informational Outlet
Referral source to

visitors & community.
Stay informed of local

events & business
information.


